
 

Tradespeople to hop on buses with new easy-to-transport
KwikPro power tools, crowdfunding soon

Friday 29 March, 2019

KwikPro will be the first 18 volt system to offer: a full range of professional-grade power tools in
one easy-to-transport case, less weight and bulk to shift on buses and trains, faster working with
everything easily to hand in one case.

Pioneering engineer and founder of Power Tool Systems, Robert Fowler, plans to launch the new
KwikPro range of easy-to-transport 18 volt power tool sets for crowdfunding mid-April 2019 on
Kickstarter.com. The all-in-one-case professional-grade power tool systems use exclusive SlideDriveTM

technology to save space and weight. The KwikPro system will include: cordless motor handles and a full
range of tool heads, a dedicated tool belt for safe hands-free carrying, and an exclusive remote control
version for working in difficult to access places.

Currently, trade-professionals have to carry multiple regular power tools in separate cases to and from
job-sites. “Shifting loads of power tools on public transport is difficult, wastes time and energy and can
increase the danger of accidents and injuries. KwikPro will make life easier for anyone who needs to
transport power tools to and from jobs by bus, train, taxi, van or truck,” said Fowler. "And when power
tool users get to their jobs they’ll be able to work faster with everything easily to hand in one case."

Fowler has worked many thousands of hours pioneering KwikPro. Fowler’s background includes working
on a diverse range of projects including developing his own design electric car, having spotted the need
for EVs many years before governments and car manufacturers; converting conventional cars to EVs;
engineering parts for EVs; consulting on “everything EV”; and engineering hovercraft. 

KwikPro sets feature high-performance 18 volt motor handles with lithium batteries and precisely
interchangeable tool heads which become a full range of professional-grade power tools including:
unique two-way drills, drivers, grinder, saws and a multi-tool. Three KwikPro sets will be offered: Gold
Diamond with 2 remote control motor handles and 10 tool heads; Gold with 2 motor handles and 10 tool
heads, and Silver with 1 motor handle and 5 tool heads. 

About KwikPro power tools

KwikPro® is a new brand belonging to Power Tool Systems, a British start-up. 

For more information on KwikPro please visit KwikProTools.com 

Power Tool Systems plans to offer KwikPro for pre-order on Kickstarter (the Kickstarter.com web
platform) mid-April 2019. Prices will be competitive with conventional professional-grade power tools from
established brands. 
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Power Tool Systems Limited  

T. 01823480196
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