
 

Specialist IT Network Consultancy firm EDNX Offers
Outsourcing Services to Cisco Partners in the UK

Tuesday 25 September, 2018

EDNX is an IT Network Consultancy company specialising in Software Defined Networks. It is founded
by two network experts David Ratcliffe and Wojtek Siodelski. They have both worked in the industry for
over 15 years and hold CCIE certifications covering Wireless as well as Routing and Switching
technologies. Both Dave and Wojtek cut their teeth on various aspects of networking and are
experienced in a vast array of industry sectors including Healthcare, Retail, Education, Manufacturing
and Finance. With this wealth of experience, they also bring incredible attention to detail and have built
strong relationships with a variety of major vendors in UK.

EDNX is founded on the principle of providing the most innovative solutions to their customers. This
approach allows their clients to stay at the forefront of their niche. At EDNX they pride themselves on
deploying state of the art technologies that can be operated by customers of all ability levels. They
specialise in designing and implementing software defined networks which is bleeding edge in the
industry right now. While they have vast experience in traditional wired and wireless solutions, their key
offerings are SD-WAN and SD-Access leveraging Cisco’s ground breaking DNA Centre platform. They
also possess in-depth expertise in RF Survey work and datacentre networking with ACI. 

The business model EDNX adheres to is one that allows Cisco partners to outsource projects when they
might not have the specific skills or bandwidth to deliver. This approach proves mutually beneficial for
both parties. They operate in small teams of highly skilled and experienced architects and engineers.
Their focus is always on minimising any disruption or downtime to customers during delivery. EDNX
architects always ensure that the implemented solutions are aligned with the business strategic and
long-term objectives.

The revolution in networking brought by Cisco DNA Center left many traditional engineers behind. This is
why EDNX is showing their in-depth understanding and knowledge in a series of technology articles on
their website. The vision is to provide a large community of experts that enable innovative technologies to
flourish within all organisations across the UK.
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