
 

SolidusX Trading App Draws Host of Positive Reviews
Online

Wednesday 20 April, 2022

First made available for download last month, award-winning mobile app for Apple and Android
provides users with ‘unparalleled’ access to global financial markets

London - The new mobile-trading app from SolidusX, now available for download at both the App Store
and Google Play, has received positive feedback in a number of SolidusX reviews recently published
online. The highly-anticipated app lets users trade on-the-go in several asset-classes, including
cryptocurrencies, forex, corporate stocks, ETFs and commodities. 

“The new app is another example of the unparalleled access to global financial markets that we offer our
clients,” SolidusX Managing Director James Fisher says. “With it, users can access markets
around-the-clock so they never miss out on potentially lucrative opportunities.”

All-in-One Mobile Trading Experience

Since the app officially became available for download last month, a number of positive SolidusX app
reviews have appeared in online forums. Reviewers have hailed the platform’s low fees and excellent
customer service, as well as its instantaneous BUY/SELL order executions. According to one glowing
SolidusX review, “customer support has been very quick to help me sort out any issues I had. As an
elder I was a bit nervous stepping into this new experience, but the easy to use platform and app
together with the full guidance of my investment specialist Mr. Neumann im having having fun, learning
new skills and making money”

Providing an all-in-one mobile-trading experience, the app features a fully-customizable dashboard,
fingerprint login and live-streamed pricing. It also provides advanced mobile-optimized charting in real
time, full-order ticket functionality, and a convenient notification center designed to keep users updated
on breaking trends and developments. The app’s other features include advanced order tickets
(including limit, stop-loss, take-profit); watchlists, multiple workspaces and instrument details
(performance, margin level, market hours, etc.); and a diverse range of deposit and withdrawal methods,
including credit cards, debit cards, crypto transfers and direct bank-to-bank wires.

According to Fisher, the new app is akin to an “added layer that helps you centralize and control all your
trading activity, enjoy full functionality, and control every other aspect of your account.”

SolidusX: Promoting Clients’ Financial Wellbeing

An open-source e-commerce platform, SolidusX (a subsidiary of London-based Solidus Capital) first
launched in 2020 with the stated aim of helping its clients promote their financial wellbeing. In 2021, with
an international customer base, SolidusX enjoyed an overall client satisfaction rate of 9.6/10, while the
company’s total revenue grew by an impressive 82.63 percent. This success is also confirmed by many
positive online SolidusX app reviews.

“We’re pushing development and investment in our technologies with a view to promoting exceptional
performance and continued growth,” Fisher says. “And we’re always exploring novel means of providing
our clients with optimal service, greater access to markets, and the highest possible levels of security.”
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