
 

New Film States That A UFO Landed At A Royal Estate

Friday 19 July, 2024

A new documentary - The King Of UFOs - explores the British Royal family's interest in UFOs and the
paranormal.

It also looks at the role that King Charles can play in bringing UFO disclosure to the UK and USA.

One incredible moment in the film is where John Hanson a retired CID Police Officer with close links with
Lord Louis Mountbatten recounts an event at Mountbatten's Broadlands Estate in Hampshire where a
labourer Fred Briggs was knocked off his bike after watching a UFO descend a land at the estate! The
testimony that Briggs gave is in the archives at Broadlands and there is also a statement from Lord
Mountbatten vouching for the integrity of Mr Briggs!

Other fabulous Royal encounters include the time when Prince Phillip nearly encountered a possible ET
called Janus at a Chelsea flat. Phillip's query Sir Peter Horsley was a UFO fanatic and used to keep
Prince Phillip up to date with all the latest UFO sighting and one time arranged a meeting with what
Horsley thought was a real Alien called Janus - who wanted to speak to people in authority who could
help spread the alien message in order to save humanity. Prince Phillip decided, wisely, not to attend and
we now know that this Janus character was most likely a Soviet spy!

Both the Queen and Prince Phillip's interest in UFOs and crop circles continued and the film recounts a
story of Queen Elizabeth II dispatching  her own scientific advisor in the middle of the night to check out
the latest crop circle formation in Wiltshire.

John Hanson author and retired CID Police Officer used to receiver letters from the Queen and Prince
Phillip thanking him for his UFO books (Haunted Skies) and they told him that they had their own library
of UFO books!

The film also looks at the testimony an evidence  from former Naval diver Dan Costello who claims in
1975 to have seen Prince Charles fly a UFO craft in Nova Scotia! Costello claims in the film that Charles
was one of 3 pilots in a dome shaped craft that had a strange electro magnetic propulsion powering it
and had a trailing blue ionic flame.

Film-maker Mark Christopher Lee - Costello's testimony is fantastical but we have verified a lot of the
information and evidence that he provided and I have also written to King Charles to verify the version of
events. If they are true then we have to question what sort of technology was this and why was Charles
flying it?

Former Ministry Of Defence officer Nick Pope looks at the role that King Charles would play if we had first
contact.

"He would have an important role to play as head of state and head of the Anglican Church. People will
look to him to provide a lead in how we react and deal with being visited by extra terrestrials."

The film is coming soon to Amazon prime  and Tubi,

watch the trailer here:

https://youtu.be/mEZT9NotoVY?si=JhdP7j48h2qz6EZ4
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