
 

Artificial Grass Now Available To Hire from Elite Artificial
Grass

Tuesday 24 November, 2020

Elite Artificial Grass, a leading supplier and installer of artificial grass in the UK, is now offering artificial
grass on a hire basis. The company has years of experience working with artificial grass and supplies its
products and services across the UK.

Hiring artificial grass provides a variety of benefits. It's a quick way to make a venue, whether indoor or
outdoor, look smart and vibrant. It has an excellent visual effect, and it is also much cleaner and tidier
than real grass. Installing it and removing it is easy and won't leave a mess. Its durability means that it
won't be easily ruined by high levels of foot traffic, but it's still comfortable and soft to the touch. Hiring
artificial grass is also a great choice for anyone on a budget, making it possible to make an event look
good without having to purchase a single-use product.

Artificial grass can be used for events of all types, from shows and exhibitions to corporate events. It can
offer a natural look that brightens up any event. It can be used to turn an indoor venue into a
garden-themed location, create an indoor sports area, and more. Fake grass hire from Elite Artificial
Grass is supplied by a team of knowledgeable installers who can quickly install and uninstall the grass,
making it easy to set up and pack away before and after an event.

Artificial grass from Elite Artificial Grass is woven for resilience and UV protected to protect it from fading
due to sunlight exposure. It is child and pet friendly and European grade for quality, plus fairly priced to
ensure both hire and purchase are affordable. There is a range of artificial grass to choose from, with the
same excellent quality across the whole range.

Elite Artificial Grass is a family business with years of experience in the industry. They strive to provide a
reliable and trustworthy service that is backed by their experience and knowledge. They can meet the
unique requirements of any business or event host, with a team of fully-trained lawn specialists ready to
take care of artificial grass hire and installation at any event. Local agents for Elite Artificial Grass can be
found throughout the UK.

The new artificial grass hire service from Elite Artificial Grass makes it easy to brighten up any event,
from shows to corporate events. Professional and knowledgeable installers will help with getting set up
for events, with no need to buy grass that isn't needed.

Visit the Elite Artificial Grass website at https://eliteartificialgrass.co.uk/ to find out more about the
company's new hire service. For press enquiries, please contact Mike Rodgers by phone on 0800 8611
721, by emailing hello@eliteartificialgrass.co.uk or by writing to Ranksborough Farm, Langham, Oakham,
Rutland, UK.
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